

Bus Trips - Town of Newburgh Recreation - 2024
 49 or 56 passanger Motor Coach with lavatory and DVD player

Item #	Date of Trip	Destination (All are round Trip)	Depart Trip	Approx. Return Time	# of Buses Needed	Leprechaun		Orange County Transit		West Point	
						Price per 38 pass.	Price per 56 pass.	Price Per 49 pass	Price per 56 pass	Price per 49 pass	Price per 56 pass
1	3/12/24	Aqua Turf 556 Mulberry St., Plantsville, CT 06479	9:30am RC	5:00pm RC	1	\$1,275	\$1,417	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,350	\$1,350
2	6/8/24	Goshen Stampede - Goshen Fair Grounds 116 Old Middle St., Goshen, CT 06756	9:30am RC	6:00pm RC	1	\$1,193	\$1,325	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,455	\$1,455
3	6/27/24	Essex Steam Train & Railroad 1 Railroad Ave., Essex, CT 06426	8:30am RC	5:00pm RC	1	\$1,457	\$1,618	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,455	\$1,455
4	7/16/24	Brownstone 351 West Broadway, Paterson, NJ 07522	10:00am RC	5:00pm RC	1	\$1,169	\$1,298	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,250	\$1,250
5	8/13/24	NYC Ferry Terminal East 35th St., New York, NY 10002	8:00am RC	3:30pm RC	1	\$1,247	\$1,385	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,350	\$1,350
6	9/10/24	Villa Roma Resorts 356 Villa Roma Rd, Callicoon, NY 12723	9:00am RC	5:30pm RC	1	\$1,275	\$1,417	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,455	\$1,455
7	9/28/24	Sesame Place 100 Sesame Rd., Langhorne, PA 19047	8:00am RC	6:30pm RC	1	\$1,629	\$1,810	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,650	\$1,650
8	10/8/24	Silver Birches 205 PA-507, Hawley, PA 18428	8:30am RC	5:00pm RC	1	\$1,305	\$1,450	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,455	\$1,455
9	11/12/24	Hotel Anthracite 25 S. Main St., Carbondale, PA 18407	9:00am RC	5:30pm RC	1	\$1,417	\$1,574	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,455	\$1,455
10	11/23/24	New York Botanical Garden 2900 Southern Blvd., Bronx NY 10458	8:30am RC	3:30pm RC	1	\$1,259	\$1,398	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,350	\$1,350
11	12/17/24	The Brownstone 351 W. Broadway, Paterson, NJ 07522	10:00am RC	5:00pm RC	1	\$1,169	\$1,298	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,275	\$1,275

Please note:

Trips are subject to cancellation due to lack of enrollment or adverse weather conditions up to 48 hrs before trip.
 This list is subject to increase as special events, tickets and shows may come up during the course of the year.

Town of Newburgh Recreation -- Bus Schedule-Camp Chadwick 2024

Pricing for School Buses (44 adult, 66 children)

All are Round Trips - From Chadwick Lake Park (1702 Route 300)

Item #	Date	Destination	Depart Time	Approx. Return Time	# of Buses Needed	Leprechaun	Orange Co Transit	West Point Tours
						Cost Per Bus	Cost Per Bus	Cost Per Bus
1	7/2/2024	Splashdown - Fishkill, NY	9:30am CLP	4:30pm CLP	5	No Bid	\$1,062.50	\$695.00
2	7/5/2024	Kruckers - Pomona, NY	9:00am CLP	4:30pm CLP	5	No Bid	\$1,125.00	\$805.00
3	7/10/2024	Howe Caverns - Howes Cave, NY	8:30am CLP	5:00pm CLP	5	No Bid	\$1,250.00	\$910.00
4	7/17/2024	Medieval Times - Lyndhurst, NJ	9:00am CLP	4:00pm CLP	5	No Bid	\$1,062.50	\$756.00
5	7/24/2024	Rockland Boulders - Clover Stadium Pomona, NY	9:00am CLP	3:00pm CLP	5	No Bid	\$937.50	\$635.00
6	7/26/2024	Showtime Cinema, Newburgh, NY	9:30am CLP	12:00pm CLP	5	No Bid	\$500.00	\$325.00
7	7/31/2024	Mountain Creek - Vernon, NJ	9:00am CLP	6:00pm CLP	5	No Bid	\$1,281.25	\$925.00
8	8/2/2024	Club Getaway - Kent, CT	8:30am CLP	6:00pm CLP	1	No Bid	\$1,375.00	\$1,050.00
9	8/7/2024	Lake Compounce - Bristol, CT	8:30am CLP	7:00pm CLP	5	No Bid	\$1,500	\$1,100.00
10	8/14/2024	Camelback Beach - Tannersville, PA	8:00am CLP	7:30pm CLP	5	No Bid	\$1,625	\$1,190.00

Please note:

Trips are subject to cancellation due to lack of enrollment or adverse weather conditions up to 48 hrs before trip.

This list is subject to increase as special events, tickets and shows may come up during the course of the year.